The General Pharmaceutical Council (Registration and Renewal
Fees) (Amendment) Rules 2019

The General Pharmaceutical Council has made these Rules in exercise of the powers conferred by
articles 36(1) and 66(1) of the Pharmacy Order 2010(a).

In accordance with those provisions, the General Pharmaceutical Council has consulted such
persons and organisations as it considered appropriate, including the persons and organisations
listed in article 36(6)(a) to (d) of that Order and, in relation to rules made under Part 4 of that
Order, the persons and organisations listed in article 66(3)(a) to (h) of that Order(b).

Citation and commencement

1.—(1) These Rules may be cited as the General Pharmaceutical Council (Registration and
Renewal Fees) (Amendment) Rules 2019.

(2) These Rules come into force on [1st July 2019].

Amendments to the General Pharmaceutical Council (Registration and Renewal Fees) Rules
2015

2. The Schedule to these Rules amends the General Pharmaceutical Council (Registration and
Renewal Fees) Rules 2015—

(a) to increase the amount of the fee payable on the grant of an application for the entry of a
person in Part 1, 2 or 3 of the Register;

(b) to increase the amount of the fee payable on the renewal of any such entry; and

(c) toremove the additional fee for the processing of any payment made by credit card.

Given under the official seal of the General Pharmaceutical Council [insert date].

Nigel Clarke

Chair

Duncan Rudkin

Chief Executive and Registrar

(a) S.1.2010/231.
(b) Article 66(3)(a) was amended by S.1. 2013/235.



SCHEDULE Rule 2

Amendments to the General Pharmaceutical Council (Registration and
Renewal Fees) Rules 2015

General

Amendment of rule 2

1. In rule 2(1) (interpretation), omit the definition of “credit card”.

Registered pharmacists

Amendment of rule 5

2.In rule 5 (entry in Part 1 of the Register following grant of an application), for “£250”
substitute “£257”.
Amendment of rule 9

3. In rule 9(1) (renewal of an entry in Part 1 of the Register), for “£250” substitute “£257”.

Amendment of rule 14

4. In rule 14 (administration), omit paragraph (3).

Registered pharmacy technicians

Amendment of rule 16

5.In rule 16 (entry in Part 2 of the Register following grant of an application), for “£118”
substitute “£121”.
Amendment of rule 19

6. In rule 19(1) (renewal of an entry in Part 2 of the Register), for “£118” substitute “£121”.

Amendment of rule 23

7. In rule 23 (administration), omit paragraph (3).

Premises

Amendment of rule 26

8. In rule 26 (entry in Part 3 of the Register following the grant of an application), for “£241”
substitute “£262”.
Amendment of rule 29

9. In rule 29(1) (renewal of an entry in Part 3 of the Register), for “£241” substitute “£262”.

Amendment of rule 33

10. In rule 33 (administration), omit paragraph (4).



